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Grief
This month’s edition is about grief and the grief process. All of us 
will experience grief at some point in time in our lives, and maybe 
some of us have experienced it most recently with the devastation 
from the pandemic. While grief and death are unavoidable, we can 
learn different ways to cope with our intense grief feelings in 
healthy ways. 

First, we have to understand what grief is, and what it isn’t, while 
also learning how this differs from depression and other mental 
health diagnoses. Grief is defined as “deep sorrow” usually as a 
reaction to someone’s death. We can experience grief from a major 
breakup in a relationship, divorce, loss of a job, loss of a friendship, 
moving from your current school or home, and more. Everyone 
experiences grief in different ways. Therefore, what may cause a 
grief reaction in you may not affect a friend or classmate the same 
way. This is why it is so important to know what grief looks like so 
we can support each other and find help when we need it. 

Grief is not necessarily depression, or a mental health crisis, it is not 
anxiety. However, grief let untreated or repressed can become 
complicated and one can develop mental health problems that need 
further intervention. 

On the next page, we will have some ideas on how to honor your 
emotions as you grieve as well as some tips to share with others 
who are suffering. May you find wellness and health as you move 
through the grief process safely. 

Your counseling team is here to support you with your grief. 
Contact us via email, appointment request, or a pass from your 
teacher.  
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